


   
 

   
 

INTRODUCTION  
 
 While agroecology as a term has been around for almost 100 years, over the last 20 
years it has gained international recognition and embeddedness in science, policy, and practice. 
It is increasingly recognised for its potential to address multiple crises in the food system, 
including climate breakdown, biodiversity loss, deteriorating rural livelihoods, food and 
nutrition insecurity, environmental degradation, and inequity (HLPE, 2019). Agroecology is 
defined as the application of ecological and social principles to the design and functioning of 
agriculture and food systems. Agroecology is differentiated from other related concepts (e.g., 
sustainable agriculture, climate smart agriculture, nature-based solutions, organic agriculture) 
by the uncompromising commitment to each of the ecological, social, political, and cultural 
dimensions of sustainability, addressing power imbalances and centering the agency, voice and 
knowledge of local people, peasant farmers and Indigenous communities.  
 ==Early academic thinking on agroecology emerged out of the careful study of socio-
ecological principles of production as observed in the practices and lives of Indigenous and 
peasant communities of Africa, the Americas, Asia, Australia, Europe, and Polynesia. Although 
these groups did not use the term agroecology, their practices are reflected in the principles of 
what is now called agroecology. Thus, agroecology as a practice has no single centre of origin 
per se but has been – and continues to be – held in a deep reservoir of practice, culture and 
knowledge in all areas of the world where peoples, nature and food systems have evolved 
together through living in deep relationship with land, nature and territory. 
 Agroecology is associated with a multifaceted body of transdisciplinary knowledge that 
aims to better understand agroecologically-based food and farming systems. Early research 
documented the practices of indigenous foodways and peasant farming systems to understand 
the principles and approaches that underpin their resilience and sustainability



   
 

   
 



   
 

   
 

Agroecology more generally requires a shift from the “monoculture of scientific 
understanding” to an “ecology of knowledge” (Santos, 2011) in which diverse forms of 
knowledge and ways of knowing exist and interact. Within agroecology, the roles of 
professionals and institutions shift away from extracting knowledge and then extending it to 
knowledge users towards facilitating knowledge co-



   
 

   
 

 
Agroecology and Technology 

The role of technology in agroecology has been a contentious issue and a point of 
ongoing debate. On the one hand, appropriate technologies have a vital role to play in the 
deepening and expansion of agroecology. On the other hand, novel technology has been a 
powerful and privileged driver of injustices that arise from industrial agricultural development. 
From the green revolution to contemporary times, the dominant trend has been the imposition 
of western agricultural technologies to raise productivity. Early distribution of technological 
packages focusing on hybrid seeds, fertilisers and chemical pesticides displaced agroecological 
farming systems, shifted entire regions towards monocultural export-oriented farming and 
displaced people-natures in the Global South through processes of depeasantisation and the 
capitalist reorganisation of agrarian relations. Today, this technology-driven approach is still 
evident in the drive for a new green revolution in Africa, and the 4th Industrial Revolution, 
including through the advancement of disruptive technologies such as automation, big data and 
gene editing.  

Agroecology is not anti-technology, yet the values and principles of agroecology demand 
a critical questioning of new technologies and their long-term impact on the agency and 
autonomy of farmers, their communities and the health of land and nature. This implies a need 
for precautionary principles and participatory technological assessments that interrogate issues 
of power, control, and the long-term implications of technologies on the functioning of 
landscapes and the structure of societies. This critical examination of technology is especially 
important when technology is being proposed as magic bullet solutions in crisis narratives. 
Under this model, solutions are proposed that allegedly solve immediate problems, yet longer-
term implications of the technologies are unknown.  Further work is needed to examine what 
kinds of technology should be refused and which are appropriate within an agroecological 



   
 

   
 

response to political and economic instability, due in large part to social and cultural 
mechanisms intrinsic to the approach, including intentionally networked relationships, shorter 
supply chains, and a high value placed on collective work. Working from the ground up, using 
diversified and distributed approaches, agroecology offers a context-specific nimbleness that is 
designed for both resilience and sovereignty. 
  
Just Transitions –
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RECOMMENDED FURTHER READING 
 
Declaration of the International Forum for Agroecology (2015). Nyéléni, Mali: 27 February 
2015. Development 58, 163–168. https://doi.org/10.1057/s41301-016-0014-4 

This declaration is the outcome of the gathering of social movements from around the world 
and provides an articulation of agroecology from a movement perspective. 

 

IPES-Food (2016). From uniformity to diversity: a paradigm shift from industrial agriculture to 
diversified agroecological systems. International Panel of Experts on Sustainable Food 
Systems (IPES) 

This seminal report provides an accessible, visual and thorough overview of the rationale for 
shifting away from industrial food systems towards agroecology.   

 
 
 


